COUNTY CLERK
COUNTY BOARD
AGENDA ITEM REQUEST

REQUEST TO PLACE THE FOLLOWING ITEM ON THE COUNTY BOARD AGENDA

For the Agenda of: _03/24/09

Mo. Day Year

FROM: County/City Purchasing Department
CONTACT PERSON: Vince M. Mejer, Purchasing Agent
PHONE: 441-8314 FAX: 441-6513

Description of the item:

X __ Award a bid or RFP for Services ___ Ratify a contract for Services
Award a bid or RFP for Products ____ Ratify a contract for Products
Reject a bid or RFP for Services Other:

Reject a bid or RFP for Products

It is the recommendation ofthe Lancaster County Engineer and Purchasing Agent to award
bid (#09-056) for Gravel Hauling to the vendors listed as the lowest responsive, responsible
bidder meeting our specifications:

Lyman-Richey
Westover Trucking

TOTAL AMOUNT: $119,379.00



City of Lincoln/Lancaster County (Lincoln Purchasing)
Supplier Response

Bid Information Contact Information Ship to Information
Bid Creator Robert Walla Asst. Address Purchasing\City & Address
Purchasing Agent County
Email 440 S. 8th St.
Phone 1 (402) 441-8309 Lincoln, NE 68508 Contact
Fax 1(402) 441-6513 Contact Robert Walla Asst.
Purchasing Agent Department
Bid Number  09-056 Addendum 1 Building
Title Gravel Surface Course Department
Material Hauling - Lancaster Building Floor/Room
County Stockpiles Telephone
Bid Type Bid Floor/Room Fax
Issue Date 02/18/2009 Telephone 1 (402) 441-8309 Email
Close Date 3/11/2009 12:00:00 PM CST Fax 1 (402) 441-6513
Need by Date Email rwalla@lincoln.ne.gov

Supplier Information

Company Lyman-Richey Corporation
Address 4315 Cuming St

Omaha, NE 68131
Contact Cherie Ward
Department
Building
Floor/Room
Telephone 1 (402) 5582727 314
Fax 1 (402) 5565171
Email cherie.ward@lymanrichey.com
Submitted 3/10/2009 1:18:21 PM CST
Total $62,217.50
Signature

Supplier Notes

Bid Notes
All bids must be submitted electronically. Please call 441-8309 if you require assistance in completing this bid.

Bid Messages

Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Insurance Requirements | acknowledge reading and understanding the Insurance Yes
Requirements.
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2 Specifications | acknowledge reading and understanding the Yes

specifications.
3 Electronic Signature Please check here for your electronic signature. Yes
4 Instructions to Bidders | acknowledge reading and understanding the Instructions Yes
to Bidders.
5 Hauling Period Acknowledgement | acknowledge and agree that rock hauling period shall be YES

from April 20, 2009 through July 2, 2009, and for the
hauling days as specified for each project.<br>
(Work may start earlier with County Engineer permission)

6 References In the event | have NOT performed any hauling contracts  YES
under the current company name for Lancaster County in
the past three (3) years, | have included 3 references in
the Supplier Response Attachment Section from
companies or entities where | have performed similar work
to that being bid within the last 12 months.<br>
Reference information must include: Company Name,
Address, Contact Name, Phone and Work Performed.

7 Price Completion Verification | have completed pricing on PAGE 1 AND 2 of the Line Yes
Items.<BR> THERE ARE A TOTAL OF 30 LINE ITEMS
ON 2 PAGES.<br>
If you do not want to submit a bid price for a certain Pit
Location, please click NO BID for that line item.

8 Agreement to Addendum No. 1 Respondent hereby certifies that the change set forth in Yes
this addendum has been incorporated in their proposal and
is part of their bid. <br>Reason: REPLACED WORD
SPECIFICATION DOCUMENT WITH A PDF
SPECIFICATION DOCUMENT. NO OTHER CHANGES.
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Line Items

# Qty UuoM Description Response

1 4,000 Tons Hauling:Lyman/Richey-Linoma to Waverly Maintnce Stockpile<br> $2.25
Hauling Time - 8 Days

Item Notes: Bid by ton only!
Project #09-29H

Supplier Notes:

2 4,000 Tons Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to Waverly Maintnce Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 8 Days

Item Notes: Bid by ton only!
Project #09-29H

Supplier Notes:

3 4,000 Tons Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF to Waverly Maintnce Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 8 Days

Item Notes: Bid by ton only!
Project #09-29H

Supplier Notes:

4 3,500 Tons Hauling:Lyman/Richey- Linoma to Raymond Maintnce Stockpile<br> $3.49
Hauling Time - 7 Days

Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-30H<br>
TO BE HAULED ON STATE HIWAYS ONLY!!

Supplier Notes:

5 3,500 Tons Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to Raymond Maintnce Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 7 Days

Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-30H<br>
TO BE HAULED ON STATE HIWAYS ONLY!!

Supplier Notes:

6 3,500 Tons Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF to Raymond Maintnce Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 7 Days

Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-30H<br>
TO BE HAULED ON STATE HIWAYS ONLY!!

Supplier Notes:
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7 3,500 Tons Hauling:Lyman/Richey- Linoma to Emerald Maintnce Stockpile<br> $3.75
Hauling Time - 7 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton price.<br>
Project #09-31H<br>
NOTE:Stockpile located 1/2 mile East of Emerald on the South side of West "O" Street.
Supplier Notes:
8 3,500 Tons Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to Emerald Maintnce Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 7 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton price.<br>
Project #09-31H<br>
NOTE:Stockpile located 1/2 mile East of Emerald on the South side of West "O" Street.
Supplier Notes:
9 3,500 Tons Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL - MORSE BLUFF to Emerald Maintnce Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 7 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton price.<br>
Project #09-31H<br>
NOTE:Stockpile located 1/2 mile East of Emerald on the South side of West "O" Street.
Supplier Notes:
10 2,900 Tons Hauling:Lyman/Richey- Linoma to SW 12th and Saltillo Road Maintnce Stockpile<br> $4.00
Hauling Time - 6 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-32H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY!
Supplier Notes:
11 2,900 Tons Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to SW 12th and Saltillo Road Maintnce
Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 6 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-32H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY!!
Supplier Notes:
12 2,900 Tons Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF to SW 12th and Saltillo Road Maintnce
Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 6 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>

Project #09-32H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY!!
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Supplier Notes:

13 3,830 Tons Hauling:Lyman/Richey- Linoma to Roca Maintnce Stockpile<br> $4.25
Hauling Time - 8 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-33H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY WITH THE EXCEPTION OF SOUTH 54TH AND ROCA ROAD SOUTH TO PIT
ROAD!
Supplier Notes:
14 3,830 Tons Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to Roca Maintnce Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 8 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-33H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY WITH THE EXCEPTION OF SOUTH 54TH AND ROCA ROAD SOUTH TO PIT
ROAD!
Supplier Notes:
15 3,830 Tons Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF to Roca Maintnce Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 8 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-33H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY WITH THE EXCEPTION OF SOUTH 54TH AND ROCA ROAD SOUTH TO PIT
ROAD!
Supplier Notes:
16 2,000 Tons Hauling:Lyman/Richey - Linoma to South 68th Street between Olive Creek Road and
Princeton Road Maintnce Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 4 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-34H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY!
Supplier Notes:
17 2,000 Tons Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to South 68th Street between Olive Creek
Road and Princeton Road Maintnce Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 4 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>

Supplier Notes:

Project #09-34H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY!
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18 2,000 Tons Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF to South 68th Street between Olive Creek Road
and Princeton Road Maintnce Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 4 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-34H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY!
Supplier Notes:
19 4,460 Tons Hauling:Lyman/Richey- Linoma to Walton Maintnce Stockpile - South 134th & A<br>
Hauling Time - 9 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-35H<br>
Supplier Notes:
20 4,460 Tons Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to Walton Maintnce Stockpile - South 134th &
A<br>
Hauling Time - 9 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-35H<br>
Supplier Notes:
21 4,460 Tons Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL - MORSE BLUFF to Walton Maintnce Stockpile - South 134th &
A<br>
Hauling Time - 9 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-35H<br>
Supplier Notes:
22 2,280 Tons Hauling:Lyman/Richey- Linoma to Davey Maintnce Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 5 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-36H<br>
Supplier Notes:
23 2,280 Tons Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to Davey Maintnce Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 5 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton price only.<br>

Supplier Notes:

Project #09-36H<br>
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24

2,280 Tons

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF to Davey Maintnce Stockpile<br>

Hauling Time - 5 Days

Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-36H<br>

25

2,000 Tons

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Hauling:Lyman/Richey- Linoma to SW 98th & Saltillo Road Maintnce Stockpile.<br>

Hauling Time - 4 Days

Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-37H<br>

26

2,000 Tons

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to SW 98th & Saltillo Road Maintnce

Stockpile.<br>

Hauling Time - 4 Days

Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-37H<br>

27

2,000 Tons

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF to SW 98th & Saltillo Road Maintnce

Stockpile.<br>

Hauling Time - 4 Days

Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-37H<br>

28

1,530 Tons

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Hauling:Lyman/Richey- Linoma to SW 100th & Hallam Maintnce Stockpile.<br>

Hauling Time - 4 Days

Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-38H<br>

29

1,530 Tons

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to SW 100th & Hallam Maintnce Stockpile.<br>

Hauling Time - 4 Days

Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-38H<br>
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30 1,530 Tons Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF to SW 100th & Hallam Maintnce Stockpile.<br>
Hauling Time - 4 Days

Item Notes: Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-38H<br>

Supplier Notes:

Response Total: $62,217.50
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City of Lincoln/Lancaster County (Lincoln Purchasing)
Supplier Response

Bid Information Contact Information Ship to Information

Bid Creator Robert Walla Asst. Address Purchasing\City & Address
Purchasing Agent County
Email 440 S. 8th St.
Phone 1 (402) 441-8309 Lincoln, NE 68508 Contact
Fax 1(402) 441-6513 Contact Robert Walla Asst.
Purchasing Agent Department
Bid Number  09-056 Addendum 1 Building
Title Gravel Surface Course Department
Material Hauling - Lancaster Building Floor/Room
County Stockpiles Telephone
Bid Type Bid Floor/Room Fax
Issue Date 02/18/2009 Telephone 1 (402) 441-8309 Email
Close Date 3/11/2009 12:00:00 PM CST Fax 1 (402) 441-6513
Need by Date Email rwalla@lincoln.ne.gov

Supplier Information

Company Westover Rock & Sand, Inc.
Address 7800 Hwy. 50
Weeping Water, NE 68463
Contact
Department
Building
Floor/Room
Telephone 402 (267) 7765
Fax 402 (267) 5511
Email
Submitted 3/11/2009 9:43:44 AM CST
Total $269,380.00
Signature

Supplier Notes

Bid Notes
All bids must be submitted electronically. Please call 441-8309 if you require assistance in completing this bid.

Bid Messages

Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Insurance Requirements | acknowledge reading and understanding the Insurance Yes

Requirements.
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2 Specifications | acknowledge reading and understanding the Yes

specifications.
3 Electronic Signature Please check here for your electronic signature. Yes
4 Instructions to Bidders | acknowledge reading and understanding the Instructions Yes
to Bidders.
5 Hauling Period Acknowledgement | acknowledge and agree that rock hauling period shall be YES

from April 20, 2009 through July 2, 2009, and for the
hauling days as specified for each project.<br>
(Work may start earlier with County Engineer permission)

6 References In the event | have NOT performed any hauling contracts  YES
under the current company name for Lancaster County in
the past three (3) years, | have included 3 references in
the Supplier Response Attachment Section from
companies or entities where | have performed similar work
to that being bid within the last 12 months.<br>
Reference information must include: Company Name,
Address, Contact Name, Phone and Work Performed.

7 Price Completion Verification | have completed pricing on PAGE 1 AND 2 of the Line Yes
Items.<BR> THERE ARE A TOTAL OF 30 LINE ITEMS
ON 2 PAGES.<br>
If you do not want to submit a bid price for a certain Pit
Location, please click NO BID for that line item.

8 Agreement to Addendum No. 1 Respondent hereby certifies that the change set forth in Yes
this addendum has been incorporated in their proposal and
is part of their bid. <br>Reason: REPLACED WORD
SPECIFICATION DOCUMENT WITH A PDF
SPECIFICATION DOCUMENT. NO OTHER CHANGES.
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Line Items

# Qty UoMm Description Response
1 4,000 Tons Hauling:Lyman/Richey-Linoma to Waverly Maintnce Stockpile<br> $2.99
Hauling Time - 8 Days
Item Notes: Bid by ton only!
Project #09-29H
Supplier Notes:
2 4,000 Tons Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to Waverly Maintnce Stockpile<br> $2.99
Hauling Time - 8 Days
Item Notes: Bid by ton only!
Project #09-29H
Supplier Notes:
3 4,000 Tons Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF to Waverly Maintnce Stockpile<br> No Bid
Hauling Time - 8 Days
Item Notes: Bid by ton only!
Project #09-29H
Supplier Notes:
4 3,500 Tons Hauling:Lyman/Richey- Linoma to Raymond Maintnce Stockpile<br> $4.75
Hauling Time - 7 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-30H<br>
TO BE HAULED ON STATE HIWAYS ONLY!!
Supplier Notes:
5 3,500 Tons Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to Raymond Maintnce Stockpile<br> $4.75
Hauling Time - 7 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-30H<br>
TO BE HAULED ON STATE HIWAYS ONLY!!
Supplier Notes:
6 3,500 Tons Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF to Raymond Maintnce Stockpile<br> No Bid
Hauling Time - 7 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>

Supplier Notes:

Project #09-30H<br>
TO BE HAULED ON STATE HIWAYS ONLY!!
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7 3,500 Tons Hauling:Lyman/Richey- Linoma to Emerald Maintnce Stockpile<br> $4.30
Hauling Time - 7 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton price.<br>
Project #09-31H<br>
NOTE:Stockpile located 1/2 mile East of Emerald on the South side of West "O" Street.
Supplier Notes:
8 3,500 Tons Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to Emerald Maintnce Stockpile<br> $4.30
Hauling Time - 7 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton price.<br>
Project #09-31H<br>
NOTE:Stockpile located 1/2 mile East of Emerald on the South side of West "O" Street.
Supplier Notes:
9 3,500 Tons Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL - MORSE BLUFF to Emerald Maintnce Stockpile<br> No Bid
Hauling Time - 7 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton price.<br>
Project #09-31H<br>
NOTE:Stockpile located 1/2 mile East of Emerald on the South side of West "O" Street.
Supplier Notes:
10 2,900 Tons Hauling:Lyman/Richey- Linoma to SW 12th and Saltillo Road Maintnce Stockpile<br> $5.15
Hauling Time - 6 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-32H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY!
Supplier Notes:
11 2,900 Tons Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to SW 12th and Saltillo Road Maintnce $5.15
Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 6 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-32H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY!!
Supplier Notes:
12 2,900 Tons Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF to SW 12th and Saltillo Road Maintnce No Bid
Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 6 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>

Project #09-32H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY!!

09-056 Addendum 1 - Page 4 of 8



Supplier Notes:

13 3,830 Tons Hauling:Lyman/Richey- Linoma to Roca Maintnce Stockpile<br> $4.95
Hauling Time - 8 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-33H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY WITH THE EXCEPTION OF SOUTH 54TH AND ROCA ROAD SOUTH TO PIT
ROAD!
Supplier Notes:
14 3,830 Tons Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to Roca Maintnce Stockpile<br> $4.95
Hauling Time - 8 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-33H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY WITH THE EXCEPTION OF SOUTH 54TH AND ROCA ROAD SOUTH TO PIT
ROAD!
Supplier Notes:
15 3,830 Tons Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF to Roca Maintnce Stockpile<br> No Bid
Hauling Time - 8 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-33H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY WITH THE EXCEPTION OF SOUTH 54TH AND ROCA ROAD SOUTH TO PIT
ROAD!
Supplier Notes:
16 2,000 Tons Hauling:Lyman/Richey - Linoma to South 68th Street between Olive Creek Road and $5.75
Princeton Road Maintnce Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 4 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-34H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY!
Supplier Notes:
17 2,000 Tons Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to South 68th Street between Olive Creek $5.75
Road and Princeton Road Maintnce Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 4 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>

Supplier Notes:

Project #09-34H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY!
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18 2,000 Tons Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF to South 68th Street between Olive Creek Road No Bid
and Princeton Road Maintnce Stockpile<br>
Hauling Time - 4 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton only.<br>
Project #09-34H<br>
HAUL ON PAVED ROADS ONLY!
Supplier Notes:
19 4,460 Tons Hauling:Lyman/Richey- Linoma to Walton Maintnce Stockpile - South 134th & A<br> $3.45
Hauling Time - 9 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-35H<br>
Supplier Notes:
20 4,460 Tons Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to Walton Maintnce Stockpile - South 134th & $3.45
A<br>
Hauling Time - 9 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-35H<br>
Supplier Notes:
21 4,460 Tons Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL - MORSE BLUFF to Walton Maintnce Stockpile - South 134th & No Bid
A<br>
Hauling Time - 9 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-35H<br>
Supplier Notes:
22 2,280 Tons Hauling:Lyman/Richey- Linoma to Davey Maintnce Stockpile<br> $3.95
Hauling Time - 5 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-36H<br>
Supplier Notes:
23 2,280 Tons Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to Davey Maintnce Stockpile<br> $3.95
Hauling Time - 5 Days
Item Notes: Bid per ton price only.<br>

Supplier Notes:

Project #09-36H<br>
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24

2,280 Tons

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF to Davey Maintnce Stockpile<br> No Bid

Hauling Time - 5 Days

Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-36H<br>

25

2,000 Tons

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Hauling:Lyman/Richey- Linoma to SW 98th & Saltillo Road Maintnce Stockpile.<br> $5.70

Hauling Time - 4 Days

Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-37H<br>

26

2,000 Tons

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to SW 98th & Saltillo Road Maintnce $5.70

Stockpile.<br>

Hauling Time - 4 Days

Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-37H<br>

27

2,000 Tons

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF to SW 98th & Saltillo Road Maintnce No Bid

Stockpile.<br>

Hauling Time - 4 Days

Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-37H<br>

28

1,530 Tons

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Hauling:Lyman/Richey- Linoma to SW 100th & Hallam Maintnce Stockpile.<br> $6.45

Hauling Time - 4 Days

Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-38H<br>

29

1,530 Tons

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Hauling:Western Sand and Gravel - Ashland to SW 100th & Hallam Maintnce Stockpile.<br> $6.45

Hauling Time - 4 Days

Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-38H<br>
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30 1,530 Tons Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF to SW 100th & Hallam Maintnce Stockpile.<br> No Bid
Hauling Time - 4 Days

Item Notes: Bid per ton price only.<br>
Project #09-38H<br>

Supplier Notes:

Response Total: $269,380.00
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Lincoln Bidding Page 1 of 4

Log Off Help

£ L
2. Welcome Robert Walla!

CITY OF LINCOLN MO R AR KA Server Time (Central): 1:01:55 pm
NEERAIOA
Home Bids Suppliers
Draft Issued Closed Awarded Cancelled

Responding Suppliers (09-056 Addendum 1)
4Return E‘Award Supplier

|- Supplier Items Responded Response Total Note to Buyer
D Lyman-Richey Corporation [View 5 62,217.50
Response]
D Western Sand & Gravel Co. [View 10 152,021.70
Response]
|:| BUEL TRUCKING, INC [View 14 206,040.00
Response]
D Westover Rock & Sand, Inc. [View 20 269,380.00
Response]
|:| Husker Trucking inc. [ View 18 277,892.00
Response]
I:l Stanford Madlock Trucking, Inc 18 280,710.80
[View Response]
Gana Trucking & Excavating [ View 20 325,317.88
Response]
|:| LeRoy Hiskey Trucking Co., Inc. 20 332,085.00
[View Response]
Items 1-8 shown of 8 1

Awarded Suppliers

Clview Supplier Award [®clear Award H#INo Award Event E]Complete Award
No Awarded Suppliers

Bid Line lItems

Description Lyman- Western BUEL Westover Husker Stanford Gana LeRoy
Richey Co Sand & TRUCKING, Rock & Trucking Madloc Trucking Hiskey Tr
&

1 Hauling:Lyman/Richey - $2.25 $0.00 $2.75 $2.99 $3.00 $3.15 $2.99 $3.50
Linoma to Waverly (4,000) (4,000) (4,000) (4,000) (4,000) (4,000) (4,000) (4,000)
Maintnce Stockpile $9,000.00 $0.00 $11,000.00 $11,960.00 $12,000.00 $12,600.00 $11,960.00 $14,000.00
Hauling Time - 8 Days
Quantity:

4,000 UOM: Tons

Item Notes: Bid by
ton only! Project #09-

29H
2 Hauling:Western Sand $0.00 $2.92 $2.95 $2.99 $3.10 $3.15 $2.99 $3.50
and Gravel - Ashland (4,000) (4,000) (4,000) (4,000) (4,000) (4,000) (4,000) (4,000)
to Waverly Maintnce $0.00 $11,680.00 $11,800.00 $11,960.00 $12,400.00 $12,600.00 $11,960.00 $14,000.00
Stockpile
Hauling Time - 8 Days
Quantity:

4,000 UOM: Tons
Item Notes: Bid by
ton only! Project #09-
29H
3 Hauling:BLUFF $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF (4,000) (4,000) (4,000) (4,000) (4,000) (4,000) (4,000) (4,000)
to Waverly Maintnce $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Stockpile
Hauling Time - 8 Days
Quantity:
4,000 UOM: Tons
Item Notes: Bid by

https://customer.ionwave.net/prod/Desktop.aspx?sid=DB02DB69-67AA -4BC9-81A9-A4530B7C... 3/17/2009
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ton only! Project #09-

29H
4 Hauling:Lyman/Richey- $3.49 $0.00 $0.00 $4.75 $0.00 $0.00 $5.63 $7.50
Linoma to Raymond (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500)
Maintnce Stockpile $12,215.00 $0.00 $0.00 $16,625.00 $0.00 $0.00 $19,705.00 $26,250.00
Hauling Time - 7 Days
Quantity:

3,500 UOM: Tons
Item Notes: Bid per
ton only.

Project #09-30H

TO BE HAULED ON
STATE HIWAYS ONLY!!

5 Hauling:Western Sand $0.00 $6.50 $0.00 $4.75 $0.00 $0.00 $5.63 $7.50
and Gravel - Ashland (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500)
to Raymond Maintnce $0.00 $22,750.00 $0.00 $16,625.00 $0.00 $0.00 $19,705.00 $26,250.00
Stockpile
Hauling Time - 7 Days
Quantity:

3,500 UOM: Tons
Item Notes: Bid per
ton only.

Project #09-30H

TO BE HAULED ON
STATE HIWAYS ONLY!!

6 Hauling:BLUFF $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500)
to Raymond Maintnce $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Stockpile
Hauling Time - 7 Days
Quantity:

3,500 UOM: Tons
Item Notes: Bid per
ton only.

Project #09-30H

TO BE HAULED ON
STATE HIWAYS ONLY!!

7 Hauling:Lyman/Richey- $3.75 $0.00 $4.45 $4.30 $5.25 $5.05 $6.28 $5.25
Linoma to Emerald (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500)
Maintnce Stockpile $13,125.00 $0.00 $15,575.00 $15,050.00 $18,375.00 $17,675.00 $21,980.00 $18,375.00
Hauling Time - 7 Days
Quantity:

3,500 UOM: Tons

Item Notes: Bid per
ton price.

Project #09-31H
NOTE:Stockpile located
1/2 mile East of
Emerald on the South
side of West "O"

Street.

8 Hauling:Western Sand $0.00 $4.90 $4.65 $4.30 $5.25 $5.05 $6.28 $5.25
and Gravel - Ashland (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500)
to Emerald Maintnce $0.00 $17,150.00 $16,275.00 $15,050.00 $18,375.00 $17,675.00 $21,980.00 $18,375.00
Stockpile
Hauling Time - 7 Days
Quantity:

3,500 UOM: Tons
Item Notes: Bid per
ton price.

Project #09-31H
NOTE:Stockpile located
1/2 mile East of
Emerald on the South
side of West "O"
Street.

https://customer.ionwave.net/prod/Desktop.aspx?sid=DB02DB69-67AA -4BC9-81A9-A4530B7C... 3/17/2009



Lincoln Bidding

9 Hauling:BLUFF GRAVEL $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

- MORSE BLUFF to (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500) (3,500)
Emerald Maintnce $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Stockpile

Hauling Time - 7 Days

Quantity:

3,500 UOM: Tons

Item Notes: Bid per

ton price.

Project #09-31H

NOTE:Stockpile located

1/2 mile East of

Emerald on the South

side of West "O"

Street.

10 Hauling:Lyman/Richey- $4.00 $0.00 $5.05 $5.15 $6.00 $5.85 $6.15
Linoma to SW 12th (2,900) (2,900) (2,900) (2,900) (2,900) (2,900) (2,900)

Page 3 of 4

$0.00
(3,500)
$0.00

$5.75
(2,900)

and Saltillo Road $11,600.00 $0.00 $14,645.00 $14,935.00 $17,400.00 $16,965.00 $17,835.00 $16,675.00

Maintnce Stockpile
Hauling Time - 6 Days
Quantity:

2,900 UOM: Tons
Item Notes: Bid per
ton only.

Project #09-32H
HAUL ON PAVED
ROADS ONLY!!

11 Hauling:Western Sand $0.00 $5.25 $5.25 $5.15 $6.00 $5.85 $6.15
and Gravel - Ashland (2,900) (2,900) (2,900) (2,900) (2,900) (2,900) (2,900)

$5.75
(2,900)

to SW 12th and Saltillo $0.00 $15,225.00 $15,225.00 $14,935.00 $17,400.00 $16,965.00 $17,835.00 $16,675.00

Road Maintnce
Stockpile

Hauling Time - 6 Days
Quantity:

2,900 UOM: Tons
Item Notes: Bid per
ton only.

Project #09-32H
HAUL ON PAVED
ROADS ONLY!!

12 Hauling:BLUFF $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF (2,900) (2,900) (2,900) (2,900) (2,900) (2,900) (2,900)

to SW 12th and Saltillo $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Road Maintnce

Stockpile

Hauling Time - 6 Days
Quantity:

2,900 UOM: Tons
Item Notes: Bid per
ton only.

Project #09-32H
HAUL ON PAVED
ROADS ONLY!!

13 Hauling:Lyman/Richey- $4.25 $0.00 $5.25 $4.95 $6.00 $5.93 $5.87
Linoma to Roca (3,830) (3,830) (3,830) (3,830) (3,830) (3,830) (3,830)

$0.00
(2,900)
$0.00

$6.00
(3,830)

Maintnce Stockpile $16,277.50 $0.00 $20,107.50 $18,958.50 $22,980.00 $22,711.90 $22,482.10 $22,980.00

Hauling Time - 8 Days
Quantity:

3,830 UOM: Tons
Item Notes: Bid per
ton only.

Project #09-33H
HAUL ON PAVED
ROADS ONLY WITH
THE EXCEPTION OF
SOUTH 54TH AND

https://customer.ionwave.net/prod/Desktop.aspx?sid=DB02DB69-67AA -4BC9-81A9-A4530B7C...
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ROCA ROAD SOUTH
TO PIT ROAD!!

14 Hauling:Western Sand $0.00 $5.65 $5.45 $4.95 $6.00 $5.93 $5.87 $6.00
and Gravel - Ashland (3,830) (3,830) (3,830) (3,830) (3,830) (3,830) (3,830) (3,830)
to Roca Maintnce $0.00 $21,639.50 $20,873.50 $18,958.50 $22,980.00 $22,711.90 $22,482.10 $22,980.00
Stockpile
Hauling Time - 8 Days
Quantity:

3,830 UOM: Tons
Item Notes: Bid per
ton only.

Project #09-33H
HAUL ON PAVED
ROADS ONLY WITH
THE EXCEPTION OF
SOUTH 54TH AND
ROCA ROAD SOUTH
TO PIT ROAD!!

15 Hauling:BLUFF $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
GRAVEL-MORSE BLUFF (3,830) (3,830) (3,830) (3,830) (3,830) (3,830) (3,830) (3,830)
to Roca Maintnce $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Stockpile
Hauling Time - 8 Days
Quantity:

3,830 UOM: Tons
Item Notes: Bid per
ton only.

Project #09-33H
HAUL ON PAVED
ROADS ONLY WITH
THE EXCEPTION OF
SOUTH 54TH AND
ROCA ROAD SOUTH
TO PIT ROAD!!

Items 1-15 shown of 30 Page 1 of 2 shown 12 [0
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LANCASTER
COUNTY

Don R. Thomas

County Engineer

ENGINEERING

Kenneth D. Schroeder - Deputy
County Surveyor

March 16, 2008

TO:! Bob Workman, Chairperson

Lancaster County Board of Commissionears

FROM: Don Thomas

?'f}f‘m ’JBW

SUBJECT:

DEPARTMENT

FY 2008 Spring Gravel Hauling to Stockpile Bid Resulis

Listed below are the low bidders on each of the projects that we are recommending for approval.

Proiect 09-28H - 4.000 Tons - Waverly

Lyman-Richey (Haufer)
Lyman-Richey (Producer)

Project 09-30H - 3,500 Tons - Raymond

Lyman-Richey {Hauier)
Lyman-Richey {Producer)

Project 09-31H - 3,500 Tons - Emerald

Lyman-Richey {Hauter)
Lyman-Richey {Producer)

Project 09-32H - 2,900 Tons - SW 12" & Saltillo Rd.

Lyman-Richey {Hauler)
Lyman-Richey {Producer)

Project 09-33H- 3.830 Tons - Roca

Lyman-Richey {Hauler)
Lyman-Richey {Producer)

FPhone 402-441-7681

444 Cherrycreek Read, Bldg. C

$2.25/Ton
$9.45/Ton

$3.4%/Ton
$9.45/Ton

$3.75/Ton
$9.45/Ton

%$4.00/Ton
$9.45/Ton

$4.25/Ton
$9.45/Ton

1 n

noau

Lincoln, Nebraska 68528

$ 9,000.00
37.800.00

e LI T M

$ 46,800.00

$12,215.00
33.675.00
$ 45,290.00

$13,125.00
33,075.00
$ 46,200.00

$ 11,600.00
27.405.00
$ 39.005.00

$16,277.50
_36.193.50
$52,471.00

Fax 402-441-8692



Lancaster County Board of Commissioners
March 16, 2009
Page Two

Proiect 09-34H - 2,000 Tons - 8. 68" St

Waestover Trucking (Hauler) $5.75/Ton = $ 11,500.00

Western Sand (Producer) $5.40/Ton = 18.800.09
$ 30,300.00

Project 09-35H - 4,460 Tons - Walton

Westover Trucking (Hauler) $3.45/Ton = $ 15,387.00

Western Sand (Producer) $9.40/Ton = 41,924.00
$57,311.00

Proiect 09-36H - 2 280 Tons - Davey

Westaver Trucking {Hauler) $3.95/Ton = $ 9,006.00

Western Sand (Producer) $9.40/Ton : = 2143200
$ 30,438.00

Project §9-37H - 2,000 Tons - SW 98" &Sailtiflo

Westover Trucking (Hauler) $5.70/Ten = $ 11,400.00

Western Sand (Producer} ' $9.40/Ton = 18.800.60
$ 30,200.00

Project 09-38H - 1.530 Tons - SW 106" & Hallam

Westover Trucking (Hauler) $6.45/Ton = $ 986850

Westermn Sand {Producer) $9.40/Ton = 14,382.00
$ 24,250.50

TOTAL $402,265.50 -

GrviRock Bid2009 Spring Gravet Hauling Bid Recommendation Mame-3-12-08





